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Operation: Push thumbwheel forward or 
backward to light, center position is off.  
Low battery Indication: Red LEDs light 
dimly.   
How to change the battery:  
1) Unscrew thumb knob at bottom of 

battery cover.  
2) Remove battery cover and note sealing 

ring location.  
3) Remove battery and install new 9 volt 

battery  with positive pole of battery 
against battery spring marked +.  (we 
recommend Alkaline or Lithium for  
long life)   

4) Verify sealing ring is on ledge & install 
battery cover.  

5) Screw in thumb knob clockwise until 
tight. 

6) How to attach lanyard: Stretch loop 
over  thumb knob.  

  
1 Year limited warranty: Rigel Systems, 

26850 Basswood, Rancho Palos Verdes 
CA, 90275 warrants to the original 
consumer purchaser of its product that the 
product will be free of defects in material or 
workmanship 1 years from the date of 
purchase under normal use. During this 
warranty period, Rigel Systems will, at its 
option, repair or replace the product without 
charge for parts or labor when delivered to 
Rigel Systems with proof of the date of 
purchase and a statement of the problem 
with the product.  Shipping and handling 
charges to Rigel Systems are your 
responsibility. This warranty does not apply 
if the product has been altered or repaired 
by anyone other than Rigel Systems or has 
been subjected to purchaser abuse, 
accident, negligence or damage 
subsequent to purchase including battery 
damage to product. This warranty excludes 
incidental or consequential damages 
resulting from the product or use of the 
product.  The product is not a toy.  Keep 
away from children. 


